
RFB 26-09DEC21 - Fire Extinguisher Inspection & Maintenance - Term & Supply 

Bidders: 
Cintas 

Korsmeyer Fire 
AEGIX Global Boundtree Medical LLC 

Protection 

Bid Tabulation 

Line Item 

4.10.1 Annual Maintenance - ABC Unit 

$ 5.31 $ 3.25 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.2 Annual Maintenance - Halotron Unit 

$ 5.31 $ 3.25 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.3 Annual Maintenance - CO2 Unit 

$ 5.31 $ 3.25 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.4 Annual Maintenance - K Class Unit 

$ 5.31 $ 3.25 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.5 Annual Maintenance - Halon Unit 

$ 5.31 $ 3.25 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.6 Annual Maintenance - Cleanguard Unit 

$ 5.31 $ 3.25 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.7 Total Annual Maintenance 

$ 31.86 $ 19.50 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.8 5 Year Maintenance - must be 

hydrotested every 5 years 
$ 142.36 

K-Class unit 
$ 37.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.9 5 Year Maintenance - must be 

hydrotested every 5 years 

Halon unit 
No Bid $ 45.00 No Bid No Bid 



RFB 26-09DEC21 - Fire Extinguisher Inspection & Maintenance - Term & Supply 

Bidders: 
Cintas 

Korsmeyer Fire 
AEGIX Global Boundtree Medical LLC 

Protection 

Bid Tabulation 

Line Item 

4.10.10 5 Year Maintenance - must be 

hydrotested every 5 years 
No Bid $ 38.00 No Bid No Bid 

Cleanguard unit 

4.10.11 Total 5 year Maintenance 

$ 142.36 $ 120.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.12 6 Year Maintenance 

21b- 2 ½lb ABC unit. Price must include 
No Bid $ 

recharge. 
14.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.13 6 Year Maintenance 

41b- 61b ABC unit. Price must include 

recharge. $ 31.37 $ 18.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.14 6 Year Maintenance 

101b ABC unit. Price must include 

recharge. $ 33.40 $ 21.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.15 6 Year Maintenance 

131b-121b ABC unit. Price must include 
$ 37.44 

recharge. 
$ 27.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.16 Total 6 Year Maintenance 

$ 102.21 $ 80.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.17 Hydrotesting Maintenance of ABC - Must 

be Hydrotested every 12 years 

21b - 2 ½lb ABC unit. Price must include 

hydrostatic test and recharge. 
No Bid $ 19.00 No Bid No Bid 



RFB 26-09DEC21 - Fire Extinguisher Inspection & M aintenance - Term & Supply 

Bidders: 
Cintas 

Korsmeyer Fire 

Protection 
AEGIX Global Roundtree Medical LLC 

Bid Tabulation 

Line Item 

4.10.18 Hydrotesting Maintenance of ABC - Must 

be Hydrotested every 12 years 

4Ib - 6Ib ABC unit. Price must include $ 31.37 $ 23.00 No Bid No Bid 

hydrostatic test and recharge. 

4.10.19 Hydrotesting Maintenance of ABC - Must 

be Hydrotested every 12 years 
$ 33.40 $ 26.00 No Bid No Bid 

10Ib ABC unit. Price must include 

hvdrostatic test and recharge. 
4.10.20 Hydrotesting Maintenance of ABC - Must 

be Hydrotested every 12 years 

13Ib - 2 0lb ABC unit. Price must include $ 37.44 $ 32.00 No Bid No Bid 

hydrostatic test and recha rge. 

4.10.21 Total hydrotesting of ABC Extinguishers 
$ 102.21 $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.22 Hydrotesting Maintenance of CO2 - Must 

be Hydrotested every 12 years 

2Ib - 2 ½lb CO2 unit. Price must include No Bid NA No Bid No Bid 

hydrostatic test and recharge. 

4.10.23 Hydrotesting Maintenance of CO2 - Must 

be Hydrotested every 12 years 
$ 38.00 $ 25.00 No Bid No Bid Sib CO2 unit. Price must include 

hydrostatic test and recharge. 

4.10.24 Hydrotesting Maintenance of CO2 - Must 

be Hydrotested every 12 years 
$ 42.00 $ 28.00 No Bid No Bid 

10Ib CO2 unit. Price must include 

hydrostatic test and recharge. 

4.10.25 Hydrotesting Maintenance of CO2 - Must 

be Hydrotested every 12 years 

15Ib CO2 unit. Price must include $ 45.00 $ 30.00 No Bid No Bid 

hydrostatic test and recharge. 



RFB 26-09DEC21 - Fire Extinguisher Inspection & Maintenance - Term & Supply 

Bidders: 
Cintas 

Korsmeyer Fire 
AEGIX Global Boundtree Medical LLC 

Protection 

Bid Tabulation 

Line Item 

4.10.26 Hydrotesting Maintenance of CO2 - Must 

be Hydrotested every 12 years 
$ 48.00 $ 32.00 No Bid No Bid 

20Ib CO2 unit. Price must include 

hydrostatic test and recharge. 

4.10.27 Total Hydrotesting of CO2 Extinguishers 
$ 173.00 $ 115.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.28 Purchase of New Fire Extinguisher Units 

2 ½ Pound ABC Unit with Vehicle 
$ 45.00 $ 36.00 No Bid No Bid 

Mounting Bracket 

4.10.29 Purchase of New Fire Extinguisher Units 

5 Pound ABC Unit with Vehicle Mounting 
$ 59.71 $ 48.00 No Bid No Bid 

Bracket 

4.10.30 Purchase of New Fire Extingu isher Units 

30 Pound ABC Unit with Vehicle 
$ 74.65 $ 72.00 No Bid No Bid 

Mounting Bracket 

4.10.31 Total purchase of New Extinguishers 
$ 179.36 $ 156.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.32 Mark-Up - New Fire Extinguishers Not 

Identified - Over Cost - % Amount 54% 25% No Bid No Bid 
Apply to Purchase of $200.00 

4.10.33 Replacement Parts 

Fusible Links $ 9.92 $ 10.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.34 Replacement Parts 

O-Rings $ - $ 1.75 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.35 Replacement Parts 

Dry Chemical Gauge $ 10.00 $ 10.50 No Bid No Bid 



RFB 26-09DEC21 - Fire Extinguisher Inspection & Maintenance - Term & Supply 

Bidders: 
Cintas 

Korsmeyer Fire 
AEGIX Global Boundtree Medical LLC 

Protection 

Bid Tabulation 

Line Item 

4.10.36 Replacement Parts 

Dry Chemical Valve Stem $ - $ 9.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.37 Replacement Parts 

Wall Bracket $ - $ 2.25 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.38 Replacement Parts 

Vehicle Bracket $ 12.00 $ 10.50 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.39 Replacement Parts 

Operating Level (Top) $ - $ 7.25 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.40 Replacement Parts 

Pull Pin Stainless Steel $ - $ 1.75 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.41 Replacement Parts 

Carry Handle (Bottom Lever) $ 13.00 $ 7.25 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.42 Replacement Parts 

Valve Body - Amerex Brand No Bid NA No Bid No Bid 

4.10.43 Replacement Parts 

Valve Body - ABC Brand $ 28.00 NA No Bid No Bid 

4.10.44 Replacement Parts 

Valve Body - ABC Brand $ 28.00 NA No Bid No Bid 

4.10.45 Replacement Parts 

Valve Body - CO2 Brand $ 65.00 NA No Bid No Bid 

4.10.46 Replacement Parts 

Valve Body - CO2 Brand $ 65.00 NA No Bid No Bid 



RFB 26-09DEC21 - Fire Extinguisher Inspection & Maintenance - Term & Supply 

Bidders: 
Cintas 

Korsmeyer Fire 

Protection 
AEGIX Global Boundtree Medical LLC 

Bid Tabulation 

Line Item 

4.10.47 Replacement Parts 

Hose Nozzle $ 18.00 $ 10.50 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.48 Replacement Parts 

Screw Nozzle No Bid $ 7.75 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.49 Replacement Parts 

Valve Stem Assembly Plastic $ - NA No Bid No Bid 

4.10.50 Replacement Parts 

Valve Stem Assembly Metal $ - $ 9.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.51 Replacement Parts 

Hose & Horn Assembly (CO2) $ 29.34 $ 28.00 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.52 Replacement Parts 

Siphon Tube $ 18.49 $ 8.25 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.53 Toilet Paper, 2-ply, minimum sheet size 

4.25" X 3.25", minimum 550 sheets per 

roll, soft, absorbent, 100% recycled $ 251.83 $ 123.75 No Bid No Bid 
content 

80 rolls/case 

4.10.54 Other Parts : % Mark-Up over cost -

Apply to $200.00 54% 25% No Bid No Bid 

4.10.55 Disposal of Halon Fi re Extinguisher 

$ 8.00 $ 2.25 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.56 Annual Inspection - Boone County Jail 

$ 106.26 $ 69.95 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.57 Semi - Annual Inspection - Boone County 

Jail $ 106.26 $ 69.95 No Bid No Bid 



RFB 26-09DEC21- Fire Extinguisher Inspection & Maintenance - Term & Supply 

Bidders: 
Cintas 

Korsmeyer Fire 
AEGIX Global Boundtree Medical LLC 

Protection 

Bid Tabulation 

Line Item 
4.10.58 Annual Inspection - Juvenile Justice 

Center 
$ 106.26 $ 69.95 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.59 Semi - Annual Inspection - Juvenile 

Justice Center 
$ 106.26 $ 69.95 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.60 Annual Inspection - Reality House 

$ 106.26 $ 69.95 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.61 Semi - Annual Inspection - Reality House 

$ 106.26 $ 69.95 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.62 Annual Inspection -Joint 

Communications - Emergency 

Management 
$ 106.26 $ 69.95 No Bid No Bid 

4.10.63 Semi-Annual Inspection -Joint 

Communications - Emergency 
$ 106.26 $ 69.95 No Bid No Bid 

Management 

4.10.64 Total Annual and Semi-Annual 

Inspections 
$ 425.04 $ 279.80 No Bid No Bid 

1st Renewal Option Percentage Price 

4.10.65.1 
Adjustment 

0% 0% No Bid No Bid 

2nd Renewal Option Percentage Price 

4.10.65.2 
Adjustment 

5% 0% No Bid No Bid 



RFB 26-09DEC21 - Fire Extinguisher Inspection & Maintenance - Term & Supply 

Bidders: 
Cintas 

Korsmeyer Fire 
AEGIX Global Boundtree Medical LLC 

Protection 

Bid Tabulation 

Line Item 

3rd Renewal Option Percentage Price 

4.10.65.3 
Adjustment 

5% 0% No Bid No Bid 

Co-Op 

Yes Yes No Bid No Bid 


